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MINUTES 

of the 3rd meeting of the delegations of Ukraine and the Russian 
Federation to Determine the Legal Status of the Sea of Azov and the 

Kerch Strait and to Delimit the Maritime Spaces in the Black Sea 

On April 27, 1998, Moscow hosted the 3rd Meeting of the Delegations of 
Ukraine and the Russian Federation to Determine the Legal Status of the Sea 
of Azov and the Kerch Strait and to Delimit the Maritime Spaces in the Black 
Sea. 

The parties addressed the following issues in the course of the negotiations: 

1. The legal status of the Sea of Azov and navigation in its waters.

2. The legal status of the Kerch Strait.

3. Delimitation of maritime spaces in the Black Sea.

4. Procedure for using the Kerch-Enikal Canal.

5. Legal problems and practical issues of cooperation in the Azov-Kerch region.

Regarding item one: the parties proceed from the premise that the Sea of Azov 
is treated as internal waters of Ukraine and the Russian Federation. 

The Russian side has stated that the status of internal waters should also apply 
to the Kerch Strait. In their opinion, delimitation of the border in the 
Azov-Kerch waters according to the 1982 United Nations Convention on the 
Law of the Sea would make it impossible to grant these waters status as 
internal waters. Meanwhile, the exercise of sovereign rights and jurisdiction in 
said maritime spaces could become possible by defining the relevant zones of 
responsibility or by reaching other agreements. 
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The Ukrainian side has reaffirmed the position previously expressed in the 
Draft Agreement between Ukraine and the Russian Federation on the legal 
status of the Sea of Azov and on navigation in its waters regarding the 
delimitation of the state border in the Sea of Azov proceeding from the 
principle of legal succession of the states with respect to the territory and the 
1982 United Nations Convention on the Law of the Sea. 

Regarding item two: proceeding from the fact that a state border has been 
established between Ukraine and the Russian Federation in the Kerch Strait, 
the Ukrainian side has reaffirmed their position on the need to enter into an 
agreement on the legal status of the Kerch Strait. The position of the Russian 
side is outlined in Item 1 of these minutes. 

Regarding item three: the parties continued discussing the draft agreement 
between Ukraine and the Russian Federation on delimitation of the continental 
shelf and the exclusive economic zone in the Black Sea, taking into account the 
agreements reached at the 2nd meeting of the delegations on July 21, 1997 in 
Moscow. 

Regarding item four: the parties have discussed interactions between the 
Kerch Commercial Sea Port and the Sea Port Authority of the ports of Temryuk 
and Kavkaz in terms of navigation safety assurance in the Kerch Strait. 

The parties have concluded that there is a need for continued cooperation 
between the Kerch Commercial Sea Port and the Sea Port Authority of the 
ports of Temryuk and Kavkaz in terms of navigation safety assurance in the 
Kerch Strait. 
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The Ukrainian side believes that Fairways Nos. 50 and 52 located in the 
Ukrainian sector of the Kerch Strait have been unlawfully declared to be a part 
of the waters of the sea port of Kavkaz. 

The Russian side disagrees with this opinion. 

Regarding item five: the Russian side handed over the Draft Integrated 
Program of Cooperation between the Russian Federation and Ukraine in the 
Azov-Kerch Region. 

The Ukrainian side will review this draft and express its position at the next 
meeting of the delegations. 

* * *

The Ukrainian side regrets to note the absence of convergence between the 
positions of the parties on the need to delimit the internal waters of Ukraine 
and the Russian Federation in the Sea of Azov and the Kerch Strait and, 
considering the substantial damage caused to the environment and fish 
resources in the Sea of Azov and the rule of law in the Azov-Kerch region, will 
be forced to consider taking steps to protect the Ukrainian sector of the Sea of 
Azov and the Kerch Strait under the provisions of international legislation and 
Ukrainian laws. 

The Russian side underscored that any practical steps involving activities in the 
Azov-Kerch waters must be taken with due account of the fundamental 
agreements on cooperation and joint use of said maritime spaces, which have 
been reached in this matter by the Presidents of Ukraine and the Russian 
Federation. 
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*** 

The next meeting of the delegations of Ukraine and the Russian Federation to 
determine the legal status of the Sea of Azov and the Kerch Strait and to 
delimit the maritime spaces in the Black Sea will take place in June 1998 in 
Ukrainian territory. 

These minutes were drawn up in duplicate, in the Ukrainian and Russian 
languages. 

FOR THE UKRAINIAN 
DELEGATION 

FOR THE RUSSIAN DELEGATION 

[SIGNATURE] [SIGNATURE] 
Yu. KOSTENKO I. SAVOLSKY

Moscow, April 27, 1998
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